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Y4 & Y5 Swimming 
 
Swimming has now finished for the children in 
Year 4 & Year 5. We hope they have enjoyed 
completing the intensive course and have learnt 
some new skills. 
 
CPS 
 
The CPS are once again holding a Zoo event at 
the shopping centre on the 9th July.  
 
Flyers with more information will be sent out 
next week. 
 
It's a popular event and it's all free! 
 
Science Festival 
 
Y3 & Y6 have gone to Preston today to take 
part in the annual Science Festival. 
 

 
 
 
Data Collection sheets Y3 – Y5 
 
Can you please send back your updated data 
collection sheets as soon as possible to the 
office. 
 
Absence 
 
It is very important that we know where your 
child is and that they are safe.  
 
If they are going to be absent from school, 
please inform the office by 8.30am or leave a 
message on the voicemail.  
 
 

 
Tempest Photos 
 
Please can you return all class, individual and 
family photos by Wednesday. They are being 
collected at 8.30am on Thursday morning. If you 
miss the deadline, you will need to pay extra for 
postage. 
 
 
Non-uniform Day 
 
We will be having a non-uniform day on 
Thursday 14th July in return for donations for our 
Summer Fair. These stalls are always very 
popular and help us to raise money to help fund 
activities for all of your children across the 
academic year. 
 
Summer Fair 
 
We will be holding our annual Summer Fair on 
Friday 15th July after school. There will be 
games, stalls, tombola and refreshments for 
everyone to enjoy. Y6 are currently designing a 
range of children’s games to ensure that there is 
lots to entertain all ages at the fair. 
 
If you would like to book a stall, please contact 
the office. 
 
We are asking local businesses for donations for 
our raffle prizes. If you know anyone that can 
donate a prize, please let us know – thank you 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
Foundation & Year 3  
 
Your child will receive a toothbrush pack on 
Monday. 
 
“Warrington Oral Health Promotion Team are 

currently working with the Primary schools in 

Warrington to set up a Toothpaste and 

Toothbrush distribution scheme. This is being 

offered to all Reception and Year 3 children. 

Our main focus will be promoting the use of 

family fluoride toothpaste amongst young 

children, as there is clear evidence to support 

the effectiveness of fluoride in reducing dental 

decay. (Delivering Better Oral Health; DOH 

2009) 

There is no fluoride added to the water supply in 
Warrington. Many young children in Warrington 
still experience high levels of tooth decay. 
Associated with this is severe pain, sleepless 
nights, time off school to attend the dentist and 
often removal of teeth. We aim to encourage 
young children to become more independent 
and take more responsibility for their health. 
All children taking part will be provided with 
toothbrush, toothpaste and an information 
leaflet and will receive one pack every 3 
months. 
A member of the oral health promotion team will 
be available to help set up the programme and 
address any issues or concerns raised by 
parents and staff” 
 
  
 
School meals & snack 
 
A polite reminder that school meals are £2.20 
and snack is 50p per day, per child. 
 
Please help Ruth in the kitchen by paying up 
front for the week or pay each day. 
 
Money pockets are available from the office. 
 
Direct debit forms are also available if you wish 
to set up a direct debit starting in September. 
This is the quickest method of payment and also 
gives you 15 free meals over the year. 
 

 
 
Bradshaw Race 
 
Good luck to our Y2 and Y3 teams who are 
taking part in the race at Bradshaw Primary on 
Tuesday.   
 
Please note if you are driving to the event that 
parking can be extremely tricky so you will need 
to allow plenty of time. If possible, please park on 
the Springbrook pub car park and walk. 
 
 
 
 
Attendance  w/e 1st July 2016 
 

Reception 96.1% 

Year 1 95.2%  

Year 2 94.2% 

Year 3 94.1% 

Year 4 93.1%  

Year 5 88.1% 

Year 6 89.3%  

Average 92.8% 

 
 
 
 
Diary dates 
 

04.07.16 Y6 Music Festival 

05.07.16 Bradshaw Race Y2 & Y3 

06.07.16 Y5 Daresbury 

07.07.16 Y6 Induction Day at Culcheth High 

12.07.16 Y1 Balance Bike session 

14.07.16 Non-uniform Day 

15.07.16 Summer Fair 

19+20.07.16 Y6 Bikeability 

20.07.16 Y3 Warrington Museum 

28.07.16 School closes for Summer 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



  



 

  


